
Re: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230237

From: esti susanti (susantiesti@yahoo.com)

To: submissions@kurdishstudies.info

Date: Saturday, 24 February 2024 at 04:32 pm GMT+7

Dear Editorial Office 

Below, I respectfully submit our research article to be available in the journal
that you manage, namely Kurdish Studies.

I need to convey the names of the researchers are:

First researcher and corresponding author:
Christina Esti Susanti - Widya Mandala Surabaya Catholic University 

Second researcher:
Yohanes Benny Suwito – Widya Mandala Surabaya Catholic University 

Third researcher:
Wahyu Prabawati Putri Handayani – Widya Mandala Surabaya Catholic University 

Fourth researcher:
Citra Anggraini Tresyanto - Darma Cendika Catholic University Surabaya

Fifth researcher
Cecilia Dwi Octavia – Widya Mandala Surabaya Catholic University 

I really hope that our article can be published in the journal that you manage,
namely: Kurdish Studies.

Thank you for the opportunity and trust you have given us.

Best regards,
Christina Esti Susanti 

On Friday, 16 February 2024 at 09:33:19 pm GMT+7, Submissions Kurdishstudies
<submissions@kurdishstudies.info> wrote:

Dear Esti Susanti,

Hope this email finds y ou well!
We are pleased to inform y ou that y our manuscript has been published in our Volume 12, Issue 2 of
2024. 

We published y our manuscript on a priority  basis and we are looking forward to future collaborations
with y ou. Manuscripts received from y ou and y our colleagues will be published within the month of
February , 2024 in Issue 2 on priority  basis.

Please wait for a few day s for indexing of y our research in Scopus. Thank y ou!
https://kurdishstudies.net/article-detail/?id=1935

Regards,

Editorial Office

4/28/24, 9:04 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230237

about:blank 1/3

https://kurdishstudies.net/article-detail/?id=1935


Kurdish Studies

https://kurdishstudies.net/

On Tue, Feb 6, 2024 at 7:59 PM esti susanti <susantiesti@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Editor Office Kurdish Studies

Thank you for the information provided.
I eagerly await the publication of our research article.

Best regards,
Christina Esti Susanti
On Tuesday, 6 February 2024 at 09:23:31 pm GMT+7, Submissions Kurdishstudies
<submissions@kurdishstudies.info> wrote:

Dear Esti Susanti,

This is to confirm that your payment has been received. Your manuscript will be published soon. Thank you!

Regards,

On Tue, 6 Feb 2024, 7:14 pm Submissions Kurdishstudies, <submissions@kurdishstudies.info> wrote:

Dear Esti Susanti,

Thank you for sharing proof of payment. We will confirm once your payment has been received. Thank
you!

Regards,

On Tue, 6 Feb 2024, 7:09 pm esti susanti, <susantiesti@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Editor Office Kurdish Studies

Below I submit proof of payment for our research articles.
Thank you.

Best regards, 
Christina Esti Susanti

----- Forwarded message -----
From: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230237 <info@srsupport.eu>
To: SRS <susantiesti@yahoo.com>
Cc: "info@srsupport.eu" <info@srsupport.eu>
Sent: Tuesday, 6 February 2024 at 09:02:20 pm GMT+7
Subject: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230237

Invoice No / Reference

Sent From SRSupport

4/28/24, 9:04 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230237

about:blank 2/3

https://kurdishstudies.net/
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com
mailto:submissions@kurdishstudies.info
mailto:submissions@kurdishstudies.info
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com
mailto:info@srsupport.eu
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com
mailto:info@srsupport.eu
mailto:info@srsupport.eu


LAUDATO SI' - LITERATURE REVIEW - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI.doc
196.5kB

KURD-20230237

Email
susantiesti@yahoo.com

Amount
800

Currency
EURO

Description
Payment for research article by Christina Esti Susanti

Payment Method
credit card

Card
xxxxxxxxxxxx6782 Visa

This receipt is computer generated. hence no seal & signature required

Sent From SRSupport

4/28/24, 9:04 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230237

about:blank 3/3

mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com


Re: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230237

From: Submissions Kurdishstudies (submissions@kurdishstudies.info)

To: susantiesti@yahoo.com

Date: Saturday, 24 February 2024 at 09:49 pm GMT+7

Dear Author,

Greetings!

Thank y ou for submitting y our manuscript to Kurdish Studies. We acknowledge y our efforts in preparing and
submitting y our valuable research. Y our submission is now with our editorial team, and the peer-rev iew
process is underway . After completion, we'll promptly  share the outcome with y ou.

Please note that upon acceptance of y our manuscript, y ou would have to pay  an article processing fee
of 800 Euros.

Regards,

Editorial Office

Kurdish Studies

https://kurdishstudies.net/

On Sat, Feb 24, 2024 at 2:33 PM esti susanti <susantiesti@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Editorial Office 

Below, I respectfully submit our research article to be available in the journal that you manage, namely
Kurdish Studies.

I need to convey the names of the researchers are:

First researcher and corresponding author:
Christina Esti Susanti - Widya Mandala Surabaya Catholic University 

Second researcher:
Yohanes Benny Suwito – Widya Mandala Surabaya Catholic University 

Third researcher:
Wahyu Prabawati Putri Handayani – Widya Mandala Surabaya Catholic University 

Fourth researcher:
Citra Anggraini Tresyanto - Darma Cendika Catholic University Surabaya

Fifth researcher
Cecilia Dwi Octavia – Widya Mandala Surabaya Catholic University 

I really hope that our article can be published in the journal that you manage, namely: Kurdish Studies.

Thank you for the opportunity and trust you have given us.

4/28/24, 9:08 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230237

about:blank 1/3

https://kurdishstudies.net/
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com


Best regards,
Christina Esti Susanti 

On Friday, 16 February 2024 at 09:33:19 pm GMT+7, Submissions Kurdishstudies
<submissions@kurdishstudies.info> wrote:

Dear Esti Susanti,

Hope this email finds y ou well!
We are pleased to inform y ou that y our manuscript has been published in our Volume 12, Issue 2 of
2024. 

We published y our manuscript on a priority  basis and we are looking forward to future collaborations
with y ou. Manuscripts received from y ou and y our colleagues will be published within the month of
February , 2024 in Issue 2 on priority  basis.

Please wait for a few day s for indexing of y our research in Scopus. Thank y ou!
https://kurdishstudies.net/article-detail/?id=1935

Regards,

Editorial Office

Kurdish Studies

https://kurdishstudies.net/

On Tue, Feb 6, 2024 at 7:59 PM esti susanti <susantiesti@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Editor Office Kurdish Studies

Thank you for the information provided.
I eagerly await the publication of our research article.

Best regards,
Christina Esti Susanti
On Tuesday, 6 February 2024 at 09:23:31 pm GMT+7, Submissions Kurdishstudies
<submissions@kurdishstudies.info> wrote:

Dear Esti Susanti,

This is to confirm that your payment has been received. Your manuscript will be published soon. Thank
you!

Regards,

On Tue, 6 Feb 2024, 7:14 pm Submissions Kurdishstudies, <submissions@kurdishstudies.info> wrote:

Dear Esti Susanti,

Thank you for sharing proof of payment. We will confirm once your payment has been received. Thank
you!

Regards,

4/28/24, 9:08 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230237

about:blank 2/3

mailto:submissions@kurdishstudies.info
https://kurdishstudies.net/article-detail/?id=1935
https://kurdishstudies.net/
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com
mailto:submissions@kurdishstudies.info
mailto:submissions@kurdishstudies.info


On Tue, 6 Feb 2024, 7:09 pm esti susanti, <susantiesti@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Editor Office Kurdish Studies

Below I submit proof of payment for our research articles.
Thank you.

Best regards, 
Christina Esti Susanti

----- Forwarded message -----
From: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230237 <info@srsupport.eu>
To: SRS <susantiesti@yahoo.com>
Cc: "info@srsupport.eu" <info@srsupport.eu>
Sent: Tuesday, 6 February 2024 at 09:02:20 pm GMT+7
Subject: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230237

Invoice No / Reference
KURD-20230237

Email
susantiesti@yahoo.com

Amount
800

Currency
EURO

Description
Payment for research article by Christina Esti Susanti

Payment Method
credit card

Card
xxxxxxxxxxxx6782 Visa

This receipt is computer generated. hence no seal & signature required

Sent From SRSupport

4/28/24, 9:08 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230237

about:blank 3/3

mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com
mailto:info@srsupport.eu
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com
mailto:info@srsupport.eu
mailto:info@srsupport.eu
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com


Re: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230237

From: Submissions Kurdishstudies (submissions@kurdishstudies.info)

To: susantiesti@yahoo.com

Date: Monday, 26 February 2024 at 09:44 pm GMT+7

Dear Esti Susanti,

Greetings of the day ! 

Congratulations on the acceptance of y our manuscript titled "ENVIRONMENT AL ET HICS T HEORY
AND GREEN CONSUMER T HEORY IN LAUDAT O SI' (LIT ERAT URE REVIEW)" for publication in
Kurdish Studies. We appreciate the quality  and significance of y our research, and we believe it will greatly
benefit our readers and the broader research community .

To proceed to the next publication stage, please adhere to the attached guidelines for pay ment of the Article
Processing Charge (APC). Kindly  follow the instructions in the invoice.

Thank y ou for choosing Kurdish Studies, and we look forward to y our continued collaboration.

Regards,

Editorial Office

Kurdish Studies

https://kurdishstudies.net/

On Sat, Feb 24, 2024 at 7:47 PM Submissions Kurdishstudies <submissions@kurdishstudies.info> wrote:

Dear Author,

Greetings!

Thank y ou for submitting y our manuscript to Kurdish Studies. We acknowledge y our efforts in
preparing and submitting y our valuable research. Y our submission is now with our editorial team, and
the peer-rev iew process is underway . After completion, we'll promptly  share the outcome with y ou.

Please note that upon acceptance of y our manuscript, y ou would have to pay  an article processing fee
of 800 Euros.

Regards,

Editorial Office

Kurdish Studies

https://kurdishstudies.net/

On Sat, Feb 24, 2024 at 2:33 PM esti susanti <susantiesti@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Editorial Office 

Below, I respectfully submit our research article to be available in the journal that you manage, namely
Kurdish Studies.

I need to convey the names of the researchers are:

4/28/24, 9:09 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230237

about:blank 1/4

https://kurdishstudies.net/
mailto:submissions@kurdishstudies.info
https://kurdishstudies.net/
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com


First researcher and corresponding author:
Christina Esti Susanti - Widya Mandala Surabaya Catholic University 

Second researcher:
Yohanes Benny Suwito – Widya Mandala Surabaya Catholic University 

Third researcher:
Wahyu Prabawati Putri Handayani – Widya Mandala Surabaya Catholic University 

Fourth researcher:
Citra Anggraini Tresyanto - Darma Cendika Catholic University Surabaya

Fifth researcher
Cecilia Dwi Octavia – Widya Mandala Surabaya Catholic University 

I really hope that our article can be published in the journal that you manage, namely: Kurdish Studies.

Thank you for the opportunity and trust you have given us.

Best regards,
Christina Esti Susanti 

On Friday, 16 February 2024 at 09:33:19 pm GMT+7, Submissions Kurdishstudies
<submissions@kurdishstudies.info> wrote:

Dear Esti Susanti,

Hope this email finds y ou well!
We are pleased to inform y ou that y our manuscript has been published in our Volume 12, Issue 2
of 2024. 

We published y our manuscript on a priority  basis and we are looking forward to future
collaborations with y ou. Manuscripts received from y ou and y our colleagues will be published
within the month of February , 2024 in Issue 2 on priority  basis.

Please wait for a few day s for indexing of y our research in Scopus. Thank y ou!
https://kurdishstudies.net/article-detail/?id=1935

Regards,

Editorial Office

Kurdish Studies

https://kurdishstudies.net/

On Tue, Feb 6, 2024 at 7:59 PM esti susanti <susantiesti@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Editor Office Kurdish Studies

Thank you for the information provided.
I eagerly await the publication of our research article.

4/28/24, 9:09 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230237

about:blank 2/4

mailto:submissions@kurdishstudies.info
https://kurdishstudies.net/article-detail/?id=1935
https://kurdishstudies.net/
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com


Best regards,
Christina Esti Susanti
On Tuesday, 6 February 2024 at 09:23:31 pm GMT+7, Submissions Kurdishstudies
<submissions@kurdishstudies.info> wrote:

Dear Esti Susanti,

This is to confirm that your payment has been received. Your manuscript will be published soon.
Thank you!

Regards,

On Tue, 6 Feb 2024, 7:14 pm Submissions Kurdishstudies, <submissions@kurdishstudies.info>
wrote:

Dear Esti Susanti,

Thank you for sharing proof of payment. We will confirm once your payment has been received.
Thank you!

Regards,

On Tue, 6 Feb 2024, 7:09 pm esti susanti, <susantiesti@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Editor Office Kurdish Studies

Below I submit proof of payment for our research articles.
Thank you.

Best regards, 
Christina Esti Susanti

----- Forwarded message -----
From: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230237 <info@srsupport.eu>
To: SRS <susantiesti@yahoo.com>
Cc: "info@srsupport.eu" <info@srsupport.eu>
Sent: Tuesday, 6 February 2024 at 09:02:20 pm GMT+7
Subject: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230237

Invoice No / Reference
KURD-20230237

Email
susantiesti@yahoo.com

Amount
800

Currency

Sent From SRSupport

4/28/24, 9:09 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230237

about:blank 3/4

mailto:submissions@kurdishstudies.info
mailto:submissions@kurdishstudies.info
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com
mailto:info@srsupport.eu
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com
mailto:info@srsupport.eu
mailto:info@srsupport.eu
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com


Acceptance-Kurd-20230262.pdf
37kB

Invoice-Kurd-20230262.pdf
236.2kB

EURO

Description
Payment for research article by Christina Esti Susanti

Payment Method
credit card

Card
xxxxxxxxxxxx6782 Visa

This receipt is computer generated. hence no seal & signature
required

Sent From SRSupport

4/28/24, 9:09 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230237

about:blank 4/4



SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262

From: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262 (info@srsupport.eu)

To: susantiesti@yahoo.com

Cc: info@srsupport.eu

Date: Tuesday, 27 February 2024 at 05:42 pm GMT+7

Invoice No / Reference
KURD-20230262

Email

Sent From SRSupport

4/28/24, 9:12 PM Yahoo Mail - SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262

about:blank 1/2



susantiesti@yahoo.com

Amount
800

Currency
EURO

Description
APC - ENVIRONMENTAL ETHICS THEORY AND GREEN CONSUMER THEORY IN
LAUDATO SI' (LITERATURE REVIEW)

Payment Method
credit card

Card
xxxxxxxxxxxx6782 Visa

This receipt is computer generated. hence no seal & signature required

Sent From SRSupport

4/28/24, 9:12 PM Yahoo Mail - SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262

about:blank 2/2



Fw: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262

From: esti susanti (susantiesti@yahoo.com)

To: submissions@kurdishstudies.info

Date: Tuesday, 27 February 2024 at 07:15 pm GMT+7

Dear Editor Office Kurdish Studies

Bellow I submit proof of payment for our research articles.
Thank you.

Best regards, 
Christina Esti Susanti

----- Forwarded message -----
From: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262 <info@srsupport.eu>
To: SRS <susantiesti@yahoo.com>
Cc: "info@srsupport.eu" <info@srsupport.eu>
Sent: Tuesday, 27 February 2024 at 05:42:04 pm GMT+7
Subject: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262

Invoice No / Reference
KURD-20230262

Email
susantiesti@yahoo.com

Amount
800

Currency
EURO

Description
APC - ENVIRONMENTAL ETHICS THEORY AND GREEN CONSUMER THEORY IN LAUDATO SI' (LITERATURE
REVIEW)

Payment Method
credit card

Card
xxxxxxxxxxxx6782 Visa

Sent From SRSupport

4/28/24, 9:13 PM Yahoo Mail - Fw : SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262

about:blank 1/2



This receipt is computer generated. hence no seal & signature required

Sent From SRSupport

4/28/24, 9:13 PM Yahoo Mail - Fw : SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262

about:blank 2/2



Re: Fw: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262

From: Submissions Kurdishstudies (submissions@kurdishstudies.info)

To: susantiesti@yahoo.com

Date: Tuesday, 27 February 2024 at 07:18 pm GMT+7

Dear Esti Susanti,

Greetings!
Thank y ou for sharing proof of pay ment. This is to confirm that y our pay ment has been received. Thank y ou!

Regards,

Editorial Office

Kurdish Studies

https://kurdishstudies.net/

On Tue, Feb 27, 2024 at 5:16 PM esti susanti <susantiesti@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Editor Office Kurdish Studies

Bellow I submit proof of payment for our research articles.
Thank you.

Best regards, 
Christina Esti Susanti

----- Forwarded message -----
From: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262 <info@srsupport.eu>
To: SRS <susantiesti@yahoo.com>
Cc: "info@srsupport.eu" <info@srsupport.eu>
Sent: Tuesday, 27 February 2024 at 05:42:04 pm GMT+7
Subject: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262

Invoice No / Reference
KURD-20230262

Email
susantiesti@yahoo.com

Amount
800

Currency

Sent From SRSupport

4/28/24, 9:13 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: Fw : SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262

about:blank 1/2

https://kurdishstudies.net/
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com
mailto:info@srsupport.eu
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com
mailto:info@srsupport.eu
mailto:info@srsupport.eu
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com


EURO

Description
APC - ENVIRONMENTAL ETHICS THEORY AND GREEN CONSUMER THEORY IN LAUDATO SI' (LITERATURE
REVIEW)

Payment Method
credit card

Card
xxxxxxxxxxxx6782 Visa

This receipt is computer generated. hence no seal & signature required

Sent From SRSupport

4/28/24, 9:13 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: Fw : SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262

about:blank 2/2



Re: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262

From: esti susanti (susantiesti@yahoo.com)

To: submissions@kurdishstudies.info

Date: Saturday, 9 March 2024 at 03:40 pm GMT+7

Dear Editorial Office
Kurdish Studies

Through this email I want to ask about our research articles. When will our article be published? We are
waiting for news from you. Thank You so much.

Best regards,
Christina Esti Susanti

On Tuesday, 27 February 2024 at 07:18:39 pm GMT+7, Submissions Kurdishstudies <submissions@kurdishstudies.info> wrote:

Dear Esti Susanti,

Greetings!
Thank y ou for sharing proof of pay ment. This is to confirm that y our pay ment has been received. Thank y ou!

Regards,

Editorial Office

Kurdish Studies

https://kurdishstudies.net/

On Tue, Feb 27, 2024 at 5:16 PM esti susanti <susantiesti@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Editor Office Kurdish Studies

Bellow I submit proof of payment for our research articles.
Thank you.

Best regards, 
Christina Esti Susanti

----- Forwarded message -----
From: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262 <info@srsupport.eu>
To: SRS <susantiesti@yahoo.com>
Cc: "info@srsupport.eu" <info@srsupport.eu>
Sent: Tuesday, 27 February 2024 at 05:42:04 pm GMT+7
Subject: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262

4/28/24, 9:14 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262

about:blank 1/2

https://kurdishstudies.net/
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com
mailto:info@srsupport.eu
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com
mailto:info@srsupport.eu
mailto:info@srsupport.eu


Invoice No / Reference
KURD-20230262

Email
susantiesti@yahoo.com

Amount
800

Currency
EURO

Description
APC - ENVIRONMENTAL ETHICS THEORY AND GREEN CONSUMER THEORY IN LAUDATO SI' (LITERATURE
REVIEW)

Payment Method
credit card

Card
xxxxxxxxxxxx6782 Visa

This receipt is computer generated. hence no seal & signature required

Sent From SRSupport

4/28/24, 9:14 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262

about:blank 2/2

mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com


Re: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262

From: Submissions Kurdishstudies (submissions@kurdishstudies.info)

To: susantiesti@yahoo.com

Date: Saturday, 9 March 2024 at 08:20 pm GMT+7

Dear Esti Susanti,

Y our manuscript is in the final stages of publication. We will share the publication link soon. Thank y ou!

Regards,

Editorial Office

Kurdish Studies

https://kurdishstudies.net/

On Sat, Mar 9, 2024 at 1:40 PM esti susanti <susantiesti@yahoo.com> wrote:
Dear Editorial Office
Kurdish Studies

Through this email I want to ask about our research articles. When will our article be published? We are waiting for news from you. Thank You
so much.

Best regards,
Christina Esti Susanti

On Tuesday, 27 February 2024 at 07:18:39 pm GMT+7, Submissions Kurdishstudies <submissions@kurdishstudies.info> wrote:

Dear Esti Susanti,

Greetings!
Thank y ou for sharing proof of pay ment. This is to confirm that y our pay ment has been received. Thank y ou!

Regards,

Editorial Office

Kurdish Studies

https://kurdishstudies.net/

On Tue, Feb 27, 2024 at 5:16 PM esti susanti <susantiesti@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Editor Office Kurdish Studies

Bellow I submit proof of payment for our research articles.
Thank you.

Best regards, 
Christina Esti Susanti

----- Forwarded message -----
From: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262 <info@srsupport.eu>
To: SRS <susantiesti@yahoo.com>
Cc: "info@srsupport.eu" <info@srsupport.eu>
Sent: Tuesday, 27 February 2024 at 05:42:04 pm GMT+7
Subject: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262

4/28/24, 9:14 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262

about:blank 1/2

https://kurdishstudies.net/
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com
mailto:submissions@kurdishstudies.info
https://kurdishstudies.net/
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com
mailto:info@srsupport.eu
mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com
mailto:info@srsupport.eu
mailto:info@srsupport.eu


Invoice No / Reference
KURD-20230262

Email
susantiesti@yahoo.com

Amount
800

Currency
EURO

Description
APC - ENVIRONMENTAL ETHICS THEORY AND GREEN CONSUMER THEORY IN LAUDATO SI'
(LITERATURE REVIEW)

Payment Method
credit card

Card
xxxxxxxxxxxx6782 Visa

This receipt is computer generated. hence no seal & signature required

Sent From SRSupport

4/28/24, 9:14 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: SRS Receipt Invoice: KURD-20230262

about:blank 2/2

mailto:susantiesti@yahoo.com
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